
) • 1 

' .. 

t· r t' Xx 5 ,5 '$ 1 12 X· 

8 Import Levy Amendment 1977, No.7 

Printed matter, viz; 
Personal identity cards 
Certificates of merit or proficiency 
Circulars, including those tYpewritten or duplicated 
Maps, charts, plans and similar articles 
Printed books, papers, music and advertising matter, but 

not including any of the :following: 
Office and other stationery forms 
Birthday and aniversary books 
Calendars and articles in calendars 

calendars or any part thereof 
Diaries 
Entry forms for competition 
Greeting and other printed cards 
picture postcards, Christmas and other picture greeting 

cards 
Show canis 
Transfers (Decalcomanias). 

Rice, when imported loose in bags or Sacks exceeding 25 pounds 
in weight. 

Sacks, and bags of jute or hemp, of a kind used for pacldng 
of goods. 

Seeds, fruit and spores, of a Idnd used for sowing. 

Ships .licensed under the .Cook Isl=ds Shipping Licence Ordinance 
1~63 and parts specially for use thereQn. 

Shooks of woods, for the assembly of fruit packing cases for export 

SpectacleS (pr~scribed by an optician or opthalmologist only) 

Stamps, postage, used or unused. 

StocY. and animal foods. 

Sugar. 

Tinplate, in sh~ets, when declared by an importer for usc by him 
only in making cans for the conveyance and packing of goods 
for produce for export. 

Very flares and rockets for use as ships' safety equipment. 

Weed and scrub killing preparations, 

Wheat 

x-Ray film (undeveloped) 

This Act ia administered by the Ministry of Trade,Industries,' 
Labour and Commerce. 

RAROTONGA, COOK ISIJU~DS: Printed under the authority of th~ 
Cook Islsnds Government, by T. KAPI, Government Printer - 1977 

1977 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 
7. 

Civil List Amendment No.8 

ANALYSIS 

1'i t.le 
Short Title and 8. 
commencement 9. 
Salary and allowance 10. 
of Premier 
Salary and allowances 
o[ Ministers 11. 
Trdvelling allowances and 
expenses of the Premier, 
Deputies to the Premier 
and Ministers 12. 
Salary and allowance of 
Speaker 
Salaries of Members 
Alll)wances of Members 

1977, No.8 

Section repealed 
Boarding allowance 
Travelling allowances and 
expenses of Members 
visiting constituencies 
Travelling allowances and 
expenses of members travelling 
within the Cook Islands on 
public service 
Salary and allowances 
of Deputies to Premier 

11'1 IIct to amend the Civil List Act 1968 
(4 April 1977 

BE IT EN1.CTED by the Legislative Assembly of the Cook Islands in 
Session 1ssembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows: 

1. Short Title and Con@encement - (1) This Act may be 
cited as the Civil List Amendment Act 1977 and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Civil List Act 1968 
(hereinafLer referred to as the principal Act). 

(2) This Act shall be deemed to have come into force 
on the first day of April 1975. 

2. Salary and allowance of Premier - Section 4 of the 
Principal Act (as amended by the Civil List Amendment Act 1973) 
is hereby amended by -

(a) Omitting from paragraph (a) the word "eight" 
and substituting the word "fourteen"; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (b) the words "Two 
thousand" and substituting the words "Four 
thousand" • 

3. Salaries and allowances of Ministers - Section 5 of the 
Principal Act (as amended by the Civil List Amendment Act 1973) is 
hereby amended by -

Price 20c 

I 
Ii 
i 

I' 
i 

J 



2 Civil List Amendment 

(a) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words "six thousand 
five hundred" and substituting the words "ten 
t.l1cusand" ; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (b) the words "one thousand 
five hundred" and substituting the words "three 
thousand". 

4. Travelling allowances and expenses of the Premier, 
Deputies to the Premier and Ministers - Subsection 

(1) of Section 7 of the principal Act is hereby amended by -

5. 
section 10 
Civil List 

(a) Omitting the words "each Minister (including 
the Premier)" and substituting the words 
"the Premier, any Deputy to the Premier, and 
any Minister"; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words "three 
dollars and fifty cents" and substituting 
the words "seven dollars". 

Salary and allowance of Speaker - Subsection (1) 
of the principal Act (as amended by section 2 of 
Amendment Act 1975) is hereby amended by -

(a) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words 
"six" and substituting the word "nine"; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (b) the words 
'bne thousand" and substituting the 
words "two thousand". 

of 
the 

6. Salaries of Members - Section 13 of the principal 
Act (as amended by the Civil List Amendment Act 1973) is hereby 
amended by 

(a) Omitting the words "two thousand" and 
substituting the words "four thousand". 

(b) Repealing the proviso. . 

7. Allowances of Members - Section 14 of the principal 
Act (as amended by section 7 of the Civil List Amendment Act 
1973) is hereby amended by omitting the words "five hundred 
dollars" and substituting the words "one thousand dollars". 

8. Section repealed - Section 15 of the principal Act 
is hereby repealed. 

9. Boarding allowance - Section 16 of the principal Act 
is hereby amended by omitting the words "two dollars and 
twentyfive cents" and substituting the words "four dollars and 
fifty cents". 

10. Travelling allowances and expenses of members visiting 
constituencies - Section 17 of the pr1ncipal Act is 

hereby amended by -

(a) Omitting from subsection (2) the words "two 
dollars and twentyfive cents" and substituting 
the words "five dollars"; 

(b) Adding a new subsection as follows: 

"(4) The member making such visits shall be 
entitled to be accompanied by his wife at 
Government expense." 

11. Travelling allowances and expenses of members 
travellin within the Cook Islands on ublic 
service - Sect10n 18 of t pr1nc1pal Act 1S hereby 

amended by omitting from the proviso the words "two dollars 
and twentyfive cents" and substituting the words "four dollars 
and fifty cents". 

Civil List Amendment 

12. Salaries and allowances of Deputies to Premier -
Section 20 I of the princIpal Act ias inserted by section 3 
of the Civil List Amendment Act 1975) is hereby amended by 

(a) Omitting from subparagraph (a) the words 
"six thousand five hundred" and substituting 
the words "ten thousand"; 

(b) Omitting from subparagraph (b) the words 
"one thousand five hundred" and substituting 
the words "three thousand". 

This Act is administered in the Legislative Service 

3 

RAROTONGA, COOK ISLANDS: Printed under the authority of the 
Cook Islands Government, by T. KAPI, Government Printer - 1977 

/ 

I 

1 

\ 

'i' 
LJ 



2 Civil List Amendment 

(a) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words "six thousand 
five hundred" and substituting the words "ten 
t.l1cusand" ; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (b) the words "one thousand 
five hundred" and substituting the words "three 
thousand". 

4. Travelling allowances and expenses of the Premier, 
Deputies to the Premier and Ministers - Subsection 

(1) of Section 7 of the principal Act is hereby amended by -

5. 
section 10 
Civil List 

(a) Omitting the words "each Minister (including 
the Premier)" and substituting the words 
"the Premier, any Deputy to the Premier, and 
any Minister"; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words "three 
dollars and fifty cents" and substituting 
the words "seven dollars". 

Salary and allowance of Speaker - Subsection (1) 
of the principal Act (as amended by section 2 of 
Amendment Act 1975) is hereby amended by -

(a) Omitting from paragraph (a) the words 
"six" and substituting the word "nine"; 

(b) Omitting from paragraph (b) the words 
'bne thousand" and substituting the 
words "two thousand". 

of 
the 

6. Salaries of Members - Section 13 of the principal 
Act (as amended by the Civil List Amendment Act 1973) is hereby 
amended by 

(a) Omitting the words "two thousand" and 
substituting the words "four thousand". 

(b) Repealing the proviso. . 

7. Allowances of Members - Section 14 of the principal 
Act (as amended by section 7 of the Civil List Amendment Act 
1973) is hereby amended by omitting the words "five hundred 
dollars" and substituting the words "one thousand dollars". 

8. Section repealed - Section 15 of the principal Act 
is hereby repealed. 

9. Boarding allowance - Section 16 of the principal Act 
is hereby amended by omitting the words "two dollars and 
twentyfive cents" and substituting the words "four dollars and 
fifty cents". 

10. Travelling allowances and expenses of members visiting 
constituencies - Section 17 of the pr1ncipal Act is 

hereby amended by -

(a) Omitting from subsection (2) the words "two 
dollars and twentyfive cents" and substituting 
the words "five dollars"; 

(b) Adding a new subsection as follows: 

"(4) The member making such visits shall be 
entitled to be accompanied by his wife at 
Government expense." 

11. Travelling allowances and expenses of members 
travellin within the Cook Islands on ublic 
service - Sect10n 18 of t pr1nc1pal Act 1S hereby 

amended by omitting from the proviso the words "two dollars 
and twentyfive cents" and substituting the words "four dollars 
and fifty cents". 

Civil List Amendment 

12. Salaries and allowances of Deputies to Premier -
Section 20 I of the princIpal Act ias inserted by section 3 
of the Civil List Amendment Act 1975) is hereby amended by 

(a) Omitting from subparagraph (a) the words 
"six thousand five hundred" and substituting 
the words "ten thousand"; 

(b) Omitting from subparagraph (b) the words 
"one thousand five hundred" and substituting 
the words "three thousand". 

This Act is administered in the Legislative Service 

3 

RAROTONGA, COOK ISLANDS: Printed under the authority of the 
Cook Islands Government, by T. KAPI, Government Printer - 1977 

/ 

I 

1 

\ 

'i' 
LJ 




