
1980 Civil List Amendment No. 20 

1. 

2. 
3. 
4. 

5. 
6. 

7. 
O. 
9. 

_
;t."; 

, >1- 1 

>1-" 

ANALYSIS 

Short Title and 10. 
commencement 11. 
Interpretation 12. 
Salary of the Premier 
Salary and Allowance of 
Deputy Premier 13. 
Salaries of Ministers 
Salary and Allowances of 
the Leader of opposition 
Salary of Speaker 
New section inserted 
Salary and Allowances of 
Assistants to the Ministers 

1900, No. 20 

Salaries of Members 
Boarding Allowance 
Travelling Allowances 
and expenses of members 
visiting Constituencies 
Travelling Allowances 
and expenses of members 
tra1/'elling w.ithin the 
Cook Islands on public 
service 

lin Act to Amend the civil List Act 1968 

(12 Decem~er 1980 
BE IT ENACTED by the Legislative Assembly of the Cook Islands 
in session assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows: 

1. Short Title and commencement - (1) This Act may be 
cited as the CIVIl LIst Amendment Act 1980 and shall be read 
together with and deemed part of the Civil List Act 1968 
(hereinafter referred to as the "principal Act"). 

(2) The provisions of this Act, with the exception of 
Sections 11,12 and 13 shall be deemed to have come into force 
on the 1st day of August 19RO. 
date of As~;~t.sections 11,12 and 13 shall come in\o force on the 

2. Interpretation - Section 3 of the principal Act is hereby 
amended by Inserting between the words "outer Islands" and their 
definition and the word "overseas" and its definition the 
.ollowing: 

"Official State Function: means a function for 
which an official invitation has been tendered 
by the Government or Head of State of the host 
country." . 

3. Salary of the Premipr - Section 4 of the principal Act 
(as amended by the civIl List Amendment Act 1978-79 No.l4) is 
hereby amended by omitting from paragraph (a) the word "ten" 
and substituting the word "fifteen". 

Price 20c 

,I 

i 



(1) 

Civil List Amendment 19Ju, No. 2f 

- Part lIB 

Deleting the words "Deputies to the Premier" and 
"a Deputy to the Premier" and substituting therefore 
the words "Deputy Premier". 

(2) Omitting from Section 20.1 the word "each". 

(J) Omitting from section 20.1. 

the words "ten thousand" from paragraph (a) 
and substituting the words "twelve thousand 
five hundred" 

(4) Repealing Section 20J substituting therefore. 

"20J - Functions of Deputy Premier - The 
Deputy Premier shall perform such functions 
as shall be prescribed for him by the Premier". 

5. Salaries' of Ministers - Section 5 of the principal 
Act (as amended by Section 3 of th'e ci vi 1 List Amendment Act 
1978-79 No.H) is hereby amended by omitting from paragraph (a) 
the word "eight" and Substituting therefore the word "twelve". 

6. 
Section 
following 

"12. Sala 
There ~s~a~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~f; 
Assembly who is for the time 
official opposition. -

(a) a salary at the rate of $8,SOO'per annum; and 

(b) a representation allowance at the rate of 
$2,000 per annum to provide for expenses 
incurred in connection with his official 
duties and his duties in connection with 
the Legislative Assembly." 

7. Salary of Speaker - Sub section (1) of section 10 of 
the principal Act (as amended by section 5 of the Civil List 
Amendment Act 1977, No.8) is hereby amended by.-

(a) 

(b) 

omitting from paragraph (a) the word "nine" 
and SUbstituting the words "ten thou9and." 

an allowance at the rate of one thousand dollals 
a year to provide for expenses incurred in 
connection with his official duties and his 
duties in connection with the Legislative Assembly 

8. New section inserted - The principal Act is hereby 
further amended by insertl.nl;J after section 11 the following new 
section.-

"UA. Allowance of the Deputy Speaker - There shall 
be paid to the Deputy speaker an allowance 
at the rate of five hundred dollars a year to 
provide for expenses incurred in connection 
with his official duties and his duties in 
connection with the Legislative Assembly." 

1980, No. 20 Civil List Amendment 

9. Salar~ and Allowances of Assistants to the Ministers _ 
Part IIA or-£ne prlnclpal Act (as inserted by the CIVll List 
~mendment Act 1969 No. 17) i.s hereby amended oy r"pealing 
Section 200 and su~stituting therefore the following.-

"200. Remuneration of Assistants to th~ Ministers _ 
There shall be pald to each AssIstant to the Ministers 

(a) a salary at the rate of $8,500 per annum; and 

(b) a representation allowance at the rate of 
$2,000 per annum to provid~ for expenses 
incurred in connection with his official 
duties and his duties in connection with 
the Leqislative Assembly" 

10. Salaries of Members - Section 13 of the princioal Act 
(as amended by Sectlon 6 of the Civil List Amentlment Act 1977 
(No. 0) is hereby amended by omitting the words "four thousand" 
and substituting therefore· the words "six thousand five hundred". 

11. Boarding Allowance - Section 16 of the principal Act 
is hereby amended by omltting the words "four dollars and fifty 
cents" ~nd substitutinq the words "seven dollars". 

13. Travellinc Allowances and Ex enses of Members travellin 
within the Coo Is r' S on pu Ie serVlce - SectIon 0 tle 
princlpal Act IS hereby amended by repealing the proviso thereto 
and substituting the following:- • 

"Provided that the rate of the travelling allowance 
payable under this Section will not exceed the actual 
hotel, motel or other accommodation hous~ tariff, or 
the sum of ten dollars per day where the member is 
accomodating privately". 

This Act is administered by the Legislative Service 

RAROTOIIGA, COOK ISLANDS. Pr in ted l.Inder the autlllr i ty of the 
Cook Islapds Government, by T. KAPI, Governm.ent .. 'rinter _ 1980. 

I 
\ 
\, 



(1) 

Civil List Amendment 19Ju, No. 2f 

- Part lIB 

Deleting the words "Deputies to the Premier" and 
"a Deputy to the Premier" and substituting therefore 
the words "Deputy Premier". 

(2) Omitting from Section 20.1 the word "each". 

(J) Omitting from section 20.1. 

the words "ten thousand" from paragraph (a) 
and substituting the words "twelve thousand 
five hundred" 

(4) Repealing Section 20J substituting therefore. 

"20J - Functions of Deputy Premier - The 
Deputy Premier shall perform such functions 
as shall be prescribed for him by the Premier". 

5. Salaries' of Ministers - Section 5 of the principal 
Act (as amended by Section 3 of th'e ci vi 1 List Amendment Act 
1978-79 No.H) is hereby amended by omitting from paragraph (a) 
the word "eight" and Substituting therefore the word "twelve". 

6. 
Section 
following 

"12. Sala 
There ~s~a~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~f; 
Assembly who is for the time 
official opposition. -

(a) a salary at the rate of $8,SOO'per annum; and 

(b) a representation allowance at the rate of 
$2,000 per annum to provide for expenses 
incurred in connection with his official 
duties and his duties in connection with 
the Legislative Assembly." 

7. Salary of Speaker - Sub section (1) of section 10 of 
the principal Act (as amended by section 5 of the Civil List 
Amendment Act 1977, No.8) is hereby amended by.-

(a) 

(b) 

omitting from paragraph (a) the word "nine" 
and SUbstituting the words "ten thou9and." 

an allowance at the rate of one thousand dollals 
a year to provide for expenses incurred in 
connection with his official duties and his 
duties in connection with the Legislative Assembly 

8. New section inserted - The principal Act is hereby 
further amended by insertl.nl;J after section 11 the following new 
section.-

"UA. Allowance of the Deputy Speaker - There shall 
be paid to the Deputy speaker an allowance 
at the rate of five hundred dollars a year to 
provide for expenses incurred in connection 
with his official duties and his duties in 
connection with the Legislative Assembly." 

1980, No. 20 Civil List Amendment 

9. Salar~ and Allowances of Assistants to the Ministers _ 
Part IIA or-£ne prlnclpal Act (as inserted by the CIVll List 
~mendment Act 1969 No. 17) i.s hereby amended oy r"pealing 
Section 200 and su~stituting therefore the following.-

"200. Remuneration of Assistants to th~ Ministers _ 
There shall be pald to each AssIstant to the Ministers 

(a) a salary at the rate of $8,500 per annum; and 

(b) a representation allowance at the rate of 
$2,000 per annum to provid~ for expenses 
incurred in connection with his official 
duties and his duties in connection with 
the Leqislative Assembly" 

10. Salaries of Members - Section 13 of the princioal Act 
(as amended by Sectlon 6 of the Civil List Amentlment Act 1977 
(No. 0) is hereby amended by omitting the words "four thousand" 
and substituting therefore· the words "six thousand five hundred". 

11. Boarding Allowance - Section 16 of the principal Act 
is hereby amended by omltting the words "four dollars and fifty 
cents" ~nd substitutinq the words "seven dollars". 

13. Travellinc Allowances and Ex enses of Members travellin 
within the Coo Is r' S on pu Ie serVlce - SectIon 0 tle 
princlpal Act IS hereby amended by repealing the proviso thereto 
and substituting the following:- • 

"Provided that the rate of the travelling allowance 
payable under this Section will not exceed the actual 
hotel, motel or other accommodation hous~ tariff, or 
the sum of ten dollars per day where the member is 
accomodating privately". 

This Act is administered by the Legislative Service 

RAROTOIIGA, COOK ISLANDS. Pr in ted l.Inder the autlllr i ty of the 
Cook Islapds Government, by T. KAPI, Governm.ent .. 'rinter _ 1980. 

I 
\ 
\, 




