
201

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 49]
CUSTOMS ACT 1986
(ACT NO. 11 OF 1986)

________

Customs (Amendment) Regulations 2016
IN exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 191 of the Customs Act 1986, I hereby 
make these Regulations—

Short title and commencement
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Customs (Amendment) Regulations 2016.

(2) These Regulations come into force on 1 August 2016 except for regulation 36 which 
comes into force on 1 January 2017.

(3) In these Regulations, the Customs Regulations 1986 is referred to as the “Principal 
Regulations”.

Regulation 7 amended
2. Regulation 7(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$18.40” and 

substituting “$25”. 
Regulation 8 amended

3. Regulation 8 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in paragraph (a), deleting “$25.55” and substituting “$35”; and

(b) in paragraph (b), deleting “$18.40” and substituting “$25”. 

Regulation 10 amended
4. Regulation 10(1)(c) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$191.15” 

and substituting “$500”.
Regulation 36 amended

5. Regulation 36(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 
substituting “$50”.

Regulation 37A amended
6. Regulation 37A(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$1,794.00” 

and substituting “$3,000”.
Regulation 37C amended

7. Regulation 37C(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$1,794.00” 
and substituting “$3,000”.

Regulation 38 amended
8. Regulation 38(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 

substituting “$100”.
Regulation 38A amended

9. Regulation 38A(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$1,794.00” 
and substituting “$3,000”.

Regulation 47 amended
10. Regulation 47 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in subregulation (3), deleting “$7.15” and substituting “$15”; and



202

(b) in subregulation (4), deleting—

(i) “$12.30” and substituting “$100”; and 

(ii) “10” and substituting “4”. 

Regulation 56 amended
11. Regulation 56(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$25.55” and 

substituting “$100”. 
Regulation 63 amended

12. Regulation 63(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) deleting “$1,279.80” and substituting “$3,000”;

(b) deleting “$1.00” and substituting “$2”; and

(c) deleting “$1,794.00” and substituting “$5,000”.

Regulation 71 amended
13. Regulation 71(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 

substituting “$50”.
Regulation 72 amended

14. Regulation 72(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 
substituting “$50”.

Regulation 73 amended
15. Regulation 73 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in subregulation (2), deleting “$7.15” and substituting “$15”; and

(b) in subregulation (3), deleting “$12.30” and substituting “$100”.

Regulation 76 amended
16. Regulation 76(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “65 cents” 

and substituting “$2”.
Insertion of new regulation 79A

17. The Principal Regulations is amended by inserting the following new regulation 
after regulation 79—

“Downtown duty free shop licence fee
 79A.—(1) The licence fee payable for a downtown duty free shop shall be $5,000 
per year. 

 (2) A licence issued under section 63K of the Act shall be renewable annually.

 (3) Where a licence under section 63K of the Act is issued during the second, third 
or fourth quarter of any year, the fee shall be respectively three-quarters, one-half or 
one-quarter of the full licence fee.” 

Regulation 82 amended
18. Regulation 82 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in subregulation (2), deleting “$7.15” and substituting “$10”; and

(b) in subregulation (3), deleting “$12.30” and substituting “$100”.



203

Regulation 84 amended
19. Regulation 84(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$22.55” and 

substituting “$50”.
Regulation 86 amended

20. Regulation 86(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 
substituting “$50”.

Regulation 91 amended
21. Regulation 91 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in subregulation (2), deleting “$7.15” and substituting “$10”; and

(b) in subregulation (3), deleting “$12.30” and substituting “$100”.

Regulation 92A amended
22. Regulation 92A(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$1,794.00” 

and substituting “$3,000”.
Regulation 94 amended

23. Regulation 94(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 
substituting “$50”.

Regulation 95 amended
24. Regulation 95(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$25.55” and 

substituting “$100”.
Regulation 95A amended

25. Regulation 95A(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$25.55” 
and substituting “$50”.

Regulation 98 amended
26. Regulation 98(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” and 

substituting “$25”.
Regulation 119 amended

27. Regulation 119 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$18.40” and 
substituting “$35”.

Regulation 122 amended
28. Regulation 122(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” 

and substituting “$25”.
Regulation 125 amended

29. Regulation 125(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$12.30” 
and substituting “$25”.

 Regulation 126(3) amended
30. Regulation 126(3) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$2” and 

substituting “$50”.
Regulation 129 amended

31. Regulation 129(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$255.55” 
and substituting “$1,500”.

Regulation 129A amended
32. Regulation 129A(b) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$25.55” 

and substituting “$50”.



204

 Regulation 132 amended
33. Regulation 132(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$127.80” 

and substituting “$1,000”.
 Regulation 133 amended

34. Regulation 133 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$25.55” and 
substituting “$50”.

 Regulation 140 amended
35. Regulation 140 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting the table of fees 

and substituting the following new table of fees—

“TABLE OF FEES

Item Document Fee

1 Landing	certificate	for	each	original	bill	of	entry	
on which goods are entered

$50

2 Certificate	of	examination	and	verification	of	the	
contents of the package, per package

$50

3 Certificate	of	weight	for	each	consignment $50

4 Any	other	certificate	issued	by	Customs $50

5 Certification	of	exports,	per	certificate $50

6 EUR—one	certificate	and	similar	certificate,	per	
certificate

$50

7 Certified	 copy	of	 any	document	 (for	 every	 100	
words or part thereof)

$50”

Regulation 140B amended
36. Regulation 140B of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) in subregulation (2)—

(i) paragraph (a), deleting “and” after “;”;

(ii) paragraph (b), deleting “.” and substituting “;”;

(iii) inserting the following new paragraphs after paragraph (b)— 

“(c) $3,500 per unit on hybrid vehicles exceeding 2500 cc but not 
exceeding 3000 cc; and

(d) $10,000 per unit on hybrid vehicles exceeding 3000 cc.”; and

(b) in subregulation (3), deleting “, Hybrid Vehicles”.

Made this 22nd day of June 2016.

A. SAYED-KHAIYUM
Attorney-General and Minister for Finance


