403

FIJI ISLANDS GOVERNMENT GAZETTE SUPPLEMENT

No. 24 FRIDAY, 24th JUNE _ 2011

[LEGAL NoTICE No. 52]

CIVIL AVIATION REFORM ACT 1999
(No. 16 oF 1999)

Airports Development and
Security (Amendment) Charges 2011

PURSUANT to Section 12 of the Civil Aviation Reform Act 1999, the Airports Fiji Limited
has amended the following charges for its services performed or facilities provided at the
Nadi International Airport and Nausori Airport~

Paragraph I amended
1. Paragraph ] of the Airports Development and Security Charges 2003 is amended
by deleting “$5.00” and substituting “$5.75”

Paragraph 2 amended

2. Paragraph 2 of the Airports Development and Security Charges 2003 is amended
by deleting “$5.00” and substituting “$5.75"

3.  These charges shall come into force on 1st July, 2011.

Dated at Nadi this 14th day of June 2011,

A, SOFIELD
Chairperson
Airports Fiji Limited

Price: 50¢ A. Y. NATVAKASORG, Government Printer, Suva, Fiji - 2011 88/FGGS2011 500
Qfficial Prirter Since 1883



