
 
 

 

REPUBLIC OF NAURU 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

EXTRAORDINARY 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- ------------------ 

No. 209                 30
th
 November, 2020                                             Nauru 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- ------------------ 

G.N.No. 854/2020 

 

ELECTORAL (PROXY VOTING) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2020 

______________________________ 

SL No. 36 of 2020 

______________________________ 

 

Notified: 30
th
 November, 2020 

Table of Provisions 

 

1 Citation .......................................................................................................................... 2 

2 Commencement ............................................................................................................. 2 

3 Amendment of the Electoral (Proxy Voting) Regulations 2016 ...................................... 2 

4 Amendment of Regulation 16......................................................................................... 2 

5 Amendment of Regulation 17......................................................................................... 2 

6 Amendment of Regulation 18......................................................................................... 2 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



-2-  

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- ------------------ 

No. 209                 30
th
 November, 2020                                             Nauru 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

G.N.No. 854/2020 (Cont’d) 

 

The Electoral Commission makes the following Regulations under Sections 78 and 136 of the Electoral Act 2016: 

 

1 Citation 

 

These Regulations may be cited as the Electoral (Proxy Voting)(Amendment) Regulations 2020. 

2 Commencement 

These Regulations commence on the day they are notified in the Gazette. 

3 Amendment of the Electoral (Proxy Voting) Regulations 2016  

 

The Electoral (Proxy Voting) Regulations 2016 is amended by these Regulations.  

 

4 Amendment of Regulation 16  

 

Regulation 16 is amended by deleting ‘2 years’ where they appear and substituting with ‘6 months’.  

 

5 Amendment of Regulation 17  

 

Regulation 17 is amended by deleting ‘1 year’ where they appear and substituting with ‘6 months’.  

 

6 Amendment of Regulation 18  

 

Regulation 18 is amended by deleting ‘1 year’ where they appear and substituting with ‘6 months’.  

 

 

 

 

 


