
THE NATIONAL 
PA,RLIAMENT ELECTORAL 

PROVISIONS 
('AMENDMENT) ACT 1992 

(NO.5 OF 1992) 



 

THE NATIONAL 
PARLIAMENT ELECTORAL 

PROVISIONS 
(AMENDMENT) ACT 1992 

(NO.5 OF 1992) 

Passed hy the National Parliament this third day of September 1992. 

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me with the Bill passed by Parliament 
and found by 171(' 10 b, a true and CO/Teet copy of the smd Bill. 

~ 
.I.M. Tullllika 

._{ 

Clerk to the National Parliament 

Assented to in Her Majesty 's name and on Her Majesty's behalf this !ifJ~th day of 
September 1992. '7"'" 

rp~~ .:::::: 
G, G, D, !.epping 
GOF('/'//or-Genemi 

Date 0/ commencement: see section I 

AN ACT To Amend the National Parliament Electoral Provisions 
Act 1980. 

ENACTED by the National Parliament of Solomon Islands. 

3 



 

 

4 

Short title 
and com-
mencement. 

Amendment 
of sec.26 of 
Act No.5 
of 1980. 

Amemdment 
of sec.44. 

1. This Act may be cited as the National Parliament Electoral 
Provisions (Amendment) Act, 1992, and shall come into force on 
such date as the Minister may appoint by notice, published in the 
Gazette. 

2. Subsection (1) of section 26 of the National Parliament 
Electoral Provisions Act 1980 (hereinafter referred to as the 
"principal Act") lis hereby amended by deleting the words "one 
hundred" and substituting therefor the words "five hundred' ~. 

3. Subsection (2) of section 44 of the principal Act is hereby 
amended by deleting the words "one thousand" and substituting 
therefore the words "seven thousand". 

Printed by the Government Printer 
Honiara, Solomon Islands 



,'\ 




