
359 

SUPPLEMENT to the SolOIDOll Islands Gazette 
Wednesday 23rd August, 1995 

[Legal Notice No. 90) 
THE EXPLOSIVES ACT 

(Cap. 108) 

S.1. No. 35 

THE EXPLOSIVES (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 1995 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 9 of the Explosives 
Act, the Minister hereby makes the following Regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Explosives (Amendment) 
Regulations, 1995. 

2. The Explosives Regulations is hereby amended in the following 
respects -
(a) in regulation 3(3), by deleting the words "ten dollars" 

and substituting therefor the words "five hundred 
dollars"; 

(b) in regulation 4(4), by deleting the words "forty dollars" 
and substituting therefor the words "eight hundred 
dollars"; 

(e) in regulation 47, by deleting the words "one dollar" and 
substituting therefor the words "twenty dollars"; 

(d) in regulation 49, by deleting the words "two dollars" and 
substituting therefor the words "twenty dollars"; 

(e) in regulation 75, by deleting the words "two hundred 
dollars" and substituting therefor the words "four 
hundred dollars"; 

(1) in regulation 97, by deleting the words "two hundred 
dollars" and substituting therefor the words "four 
hundred dollar~" . 

Dated at HOhiara this sixteenth day of August, 1995. 

V., NGELE 
Miuue! ::If Police 


