
471

[Legal Notice No. 45]

THE HONIARA CITY COUNCIL (ELECTIONS) (AMENDMENT)

REGULATIONS 2019

Table of provisions

1 Citation 1

2 Commencement 1

3 Amendment to regulation 9(1) 1

4 Amendment to regulation 49 1

5 Amendment to regulation 50(1) 1

6 Amendment to regulation 51(4) 1

7 Amendment to regulation 52 2

8 Amendment to regulation 56 2

9 Amendment to regulation 59 2

10 Amendment to regulation 60 2

11 Amendment to regulation 61(2) 2



472

THE HONIARA CITY COUNCIL (ELECTIONS) 

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2019

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 18 of the Honiara City Act 1999,

the Minister for Home Affairs makes the following Regulations:

1 Citation

These Regulations may be cited as The Honiara City Council (Elections)

(Amendment) Regulations 2019.

2 Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date of publication in the Gazette.

3 Amendment to regulation 9(1)

Regulation 9(1) of The Honiara City Council (Elections) Regulations

1999, is amended by deleting “five hundred dollars” and substituting

“$2500.00”.

4 Amendment to regulation 49

Regulation 49 of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “fifty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and

(b) deleting “three months” and substituting “1 year”.

5 Amendment to regulation 50(1)

Regulation 50(1) of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “one hundred dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”;
and 

(b) deleting “three months” and substituting “1 year”.

6 Amendment to regulation 51(4)

Regulation 51(4) of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “fifty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and

(b) deleting “two months” and substituting “1 year”.



473

7 Amendment to regulation 52

Regulation 52 of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “one hundred dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and

(b) deleting “three months” and substituting “1 year”.

8 Amendment to regulation 56

Regulation 56 of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “fifty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and

(b) deleting “two months” and substituting “1 year”.

9 Amendment to regulation 59

Regulation 59 of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “fifty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and 

(b) deleting “two months” and substituting “1 year”.

10 Amendment to regulation 60

Regulation 60 of the principal regulations is amended by:

(a) deleting “fifty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”; and 

(b) deleting “two months” and substituting “1 year”.

11 Amendment to regulation 61(2)

Regulation 61(2) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting

“twenty dollars” and substituting “$5000.00”.



MADE IN HONIARA this twentieth-eighth day of March, 2019.

HON. ISHMAEL MALI AVUI
MINISTER FOR HOME AFFAIRS

474




