
[Legal Notice No. 27]

POLITICAL PARTIES INTEGRITY (POLITICAL PARTIES

COMMISSION) (REMUNERATION) REGULATIONS 2019

Table of provisions

1 Citation 1
2 Commencement 1
3 Remuneration of Commissioners 1



POLITICAL PARTIES INTEGRITY (POLITICAL PARTIES

COMMISSION) (REMUNERATION) REGULATIONS 2019

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 12 of the Political Parties

Integrity Act 2014, I make the following Regulations:

1 Citation 

These Regulations may be cited as the Political Parties Integrity 

(Political Parties Commission) (Remuneration) Regulations 2019.

2 Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date it is published in the 

Gazette.

3 Remuneration of Commissioners

A member of the Political Parties Commission must be paid the 

following remuneration for each sitting of the Commission:

(a) Chairperson – $1,100;

(b) other members – $1,000.

MADE AT HONIARA this nineteenth day of March, 2019.

HON. RICK HOUENIPWELA

PRIME MINISTER

________________________________________________________

72



[Legal Notice No. 28]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 

SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2019

Table of provisions

1 Citation 1

2 Commencement 1

3 Regulations amended 1

4 Amendment of regulation 4 1

5 Amendment of regulation 6 1

6 Amendment of regulation 7 1

7 New Regulation 9 1

8 Amendment to regulation 12 2

9 Amendment to regulation 12A 2

10 Amendment to regulation 14 2

11 Amendment to regulation 16 2

12 Amendment to regulation 22 2

13 Amendment to regulation 23 2

14 New Regulation 24 3

73



CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 

SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2019

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices

(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act (Cap. 84), I make the following Regulations:

1. Citation 

These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms

and Conditions of Service) (Speaker) (Amendment) Regulations 2019.

2 Commencement

These Regulations commence on the date of publication in the Gazette.

3 Regulations amended

These regulations amend the Principal regulations, Constitutional 

Services (Terms and Conditions of Service) (Speaker) Regulations

(Legal Notice No. 144 of 1990).

4 Amendment of regulation 4

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “$8652.19” and substituting

“$8911.76”.

5 Amendment of regulation 6

Regulation 6 is amended by deleting “$12 000.00” and substituting

“$15 000.00”.

6 Amendment of regulation 7

Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “$4000.00” and substituting 

“$5000.00”.

74



7 New Regulation 9

The Principal Regulations is amended by deleting regulation 9 and

substituting the following:

“(9) 1 The Speaker shall be provided with a vehicle free of charge.

2 If the Speaker is not provided with a vehicle free of charge, he or

she is entitled to the following allowances:

(a) monthly vehicle allowance – $5000.00;

(b) monthly Fuel allowance – $2000.00.

8 Amendment to regulation 12

Regulation 12(1) is amended by deleting “$250.00” and substituting

“$350.00”.

9 Amendment to regulation 12A

Regulation 12A is amended by deleting “$250.00” and substituting

“$300.00”.

10 Amendment to regulation 14

Regulation 14 is amended by deleting “$10 000.00” and substituting

“$12 000.00”.

11 Amendment to regulation 16

Regulation 15 is amended by deleting “$10 000.00” and substituting

“$12 000.00”.

12 Amendment to regulation 22

Regulation 22 is amended by deleting “$150 000.00” and substituting 

“$400 000.00”.

75



13 Amendment to regulation 23

Regulation 23 is amendment by deleting “$10 000.00” and substituting

“$15 000.00”.

14 New Regulation 24

A new regulation is inserted after regulation 23 as follows:

“24.  The Speaker is entitled to a monthly telephone allowance of 

$2000.00”.

DATED IN HONIARA this twentieth day of March, 2019.

HON. RICK HOUENIPWELA

PRIME MINISTER

76




