
114 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Monday, 2211d  March 1999 	 S. 1. No. 8 

(Legal Notice No. 22) 

THE REVISED EDITION OF THE 
LAWS ACT 

(No. 5 of 1995) 

THE REVISED EDITION OF THE LAWS 
(RECTIFICATION OF ERRORS) ORDER 1999 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by seciton 11(1) of the 
Revised Edition of the Laws Act 1995, the Attorney-General 
hereby makes the following order:- 

1. This Order may be cited as the Revised Edition of 
the Laws (Rectification of Errors) order 1999. 

2. The Explosives Regulations are hereby amended Cap. 79 Sub. 

in the following respects - 	 Leg. p.  2422 

(a) in regulation 3(3), by deleting the words 
"ten dollars" and substituting therefor the words "five 
hundred dollars"; 

(b) in regulation 4(4), by deleting the words 
"forty dollars" and substituting therefor the words "eight 
hundred dollars"; 

(c) in regulation 47, by deleting the words 
"one dollar" and substituting therefor the words "twenty 
dollars"; 

(d) in regulation 49, by deleting the words 
"two dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"twenty dollars"; 



115 

(e) in regulation 75, by deleting the words 
"two hundred dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"four hundred dollars"; and 

(f) in regulation 97, by deleting the words 
"two hundred dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"four hundred dollars". 

Cap. 80 Sub. 	 3. 	The First Schedule to the Firearms, Ammunition 
Leg. p. 2478 

	

	and Air Weapons Regulations is hereby deleted and the follow- 
ing new Schedule substituted therefor - 

"FIRST SCHEDULE 
(Regulation 2) 	LN. 91/1995 

Fees. 

Section or $ 
Regulation 

s.6(2) Grant of firearm licence $200.00 
s.6(2) Renewal of firearm licence $100.00 
s.6(6) Variation of firearm licence $50.00 

on application 

s. 10 Replacement of lost licence $100.00 
s. 11(2) Grant/renewal of Dealer's licence $1,200.00 
s. 11(2) Grant/renewal of only $250.00 

ammunition Dealer's licence 

s. 15(2) Import licence for firearm! $100.00 
ammunition 

s.21 Grant/renewal of transit licence $100.00 
reg. 9(6) Grant/renewal of air weapons $100.00 

import Permit 

reg. 9(7) Grant/renewal of air weapons $500.00 
Dealer's licence 

* 



116 

Section or 
	

01 

Regulation 

reg. 9(8) 	 Grant/renewal of air 	$100.00" 
weapons licence 

Made at Honiara this eighteenth day of March 1999. 

PRIMO M. AFEAU 
Attorney-General 


