
114 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Monday, 2211d  March 1999 	 S. 1. No. 8 

(Legal Notice No. 22) 

THE REVISED EDITION OF THE 
LAWS ACT 

(No. 5 of 1995) 

THE REVISED EDITION OF THE LAWS 
(RECTIFICATION OF ERRORS) ORDER 1999 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by seciton 11(1) of the 
Revised Edition of the Laws Act 1995, the Attorney-General 
hereby makes the following order:- 

1. This Order may be cited as the Revised Edition of 
the Laws (Rectification of Errors) order 1999. 

2. The Explosives Regulations are hereby amended Cap. 79 Sub. 

in the following respects - 	 Leg. p.  2422 

(a) in regulation 3(3), by deleting the words 
"ten dollars" and substituting therefor the words "five 
hundred dollars"; 

(b) in regulation 4(4), by deleting the words 
"forty dollars" and substituting therefor the words "eight 
hundred dollars"; 

(c) in regulation 47, by deleting the words 
"one dollar" and substituting therefor the words "twenty 
dollars"; 

(d) in regulation 49, by deleting the words 
"two dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"twenty dollars"; 



115 

(e) in regulation 75, by deleting the words 
"two hundred dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"four hundred dollars"; and 

(f) in regulation 97, by deleting the words 
"two hundred dollars" and substituting therefor the words 
"four hundred dollars". 

Cap. 80 Sub. 	 3. 	The First Schedule to the Firearms, Ammunition 
Leg. p. 2478 

	

	and Air Weapons Regulations is hereby deleted and the follow- 
ing new Schedule substituted therefor - 

"FIRST SCHEDULE 
(Regulation 2) 	LN. 91/1995 

Fees. 

Section or $ 
Regulation 

s.6(2) Grant of firearm licence $200.00 
s.6(2) Renewal of firearm licence $100.00 
s.6(6) Variation of firearm licence $50.00 

on application 

s. 10 Replacement of lost licence $100.00 
s. 11(2) Grant/renewal of Dealer's licence $1,200.00 
s. 11(2) Grant/renewal of only $250.00 

ammunition Dealer's licence 

s. 15(2) Import licence for firearm! $100.00 
ammunition 

s.21 Grant/renewal of transit licence $100.00 
reg. 9(6) Grant/renewal of air weapons $100.00 

import Permit 

reg. 9(7) Grant/renewal of air weapons $500.00 
Dealer's licence 

* 



116 

Section or 
	

01 

Regulation 

reg. 9(8) 	 Grant/renewal of air 	$100.00" 
weapons licence 

Made at Honiara this eighteenth day of March 1999. 

PRIMO M. AFEAU 
Attorney-General 



117 

(Legal Notice No. 23) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

ARRANGEMENT OF RULES 

Rule: 

I. 	Citation. 

2. Revocation of 1913 Order-in-Council 

3. Admission requirements. 

4. Application. 

5. Admission. 

6. Provisional admission. 

7. Application for provisional admission. 

8. Admission under section 4 of the Act. 

9. Restrictions in relation to admission. 

10. Application for admission to practise without restriction. 

11. Admission without restriction or extension of restriction. 

12. Application fees. 

13. Oath or affirmaiton and endorsement of certificate. 

14. Production of certificate. 

15. Admission without limit of time. 

16. Practising certificate. 

17. Discretion of the Chief Justice. 

18. Making false statement in any document or application. 

19. Transitional provisions. 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

SECOND SCHEDULE 



118 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 21 of the 
Legal Practitioners Act, 1987, and in consultation with the Rules 
Committee, I, SIR (GILBERT) JOHN BAPTIST MURIA, Chief 
Justice, do hereby make the following rules - 

1. These Rules may be cited as the Legal Citation. 

Practitioners (Admission) Rules, 1996, and shall come into 
operation in accordance with section 21(4) of the Legal 
Practitioners Act 1987. 

2. The Rules of Court for the Admission of Persons Revocation 
to Practise as Barristers and Solicitors in the High Court of of 1913 

Solomon Islands made under the provisions of Article 4 of the Order-in-

Pacific 
 

 (Barristers and Solicitors) Order in Council 1913 as 
Council. 

amended from time to time are hereby revoked. 

3. Any person who, at the time of application, is Admission 

entitled to practise as a barrister, solicitor or legal practitioner in requirements. 

any Commonwealth country and has so practised for at least five 
years immediately preceding the application may apply for 
admission as a legal practitioner in Solomon Islands. 

4. (1) 	Every application for admission shall be Application. 
made by way of petition to the Court at least one (1) month 
before an applicant files his petition together with - 

(a) an affidavit verifying that the petitioner 
has been admitted to the Bar in a Commonwealth 
country and is entitled to practise and has in fact 
practised in such jurisdiction for a period of not less than 
five years; 

(b) true copies of certificates and documents 
certifying to the petitioner's entitlement to practise; 

(c) evidence that the petitioner at the time of 
application continues to practise in such jurisdiciton or if 
he has ceased to practise, the reason for so doing; and 



119 

(d) 	a certificate under the hand and seal of a 
Judge of a Court before which the petitioner last 
practised stating that such petitioner is a fit and proper 
person to be admitted. 

(2) On receipt of an application referred to in subrule 
(1), the Registrar shall forward such application to the Solomon 
Islands Bar Assocition for its comments or recommendation. 

(3) The Bar Association's endorsement (which must 
be produced to the Court) must be obtained or if the Bar 
Association does not endorse an application, this fact must also 
be communicated to the Court in writing. 

(4) An applicant's petition must be moved in open 
Court on a day set aside by the Registrar for the hearing of 
admission petitions. 

Admission. 	 5. 	(1) 	The Court, on being satisfied that the 
applicant - 

(a) has satisfied the conditions specified in 
rule 3; and 

(b) is a fit and proper person to be admitted, 

may admit such person as a barrister and solicitor of the High 
Court of Solomon Islands. 

(2) 	The admission referred to in subrule (I) may be a 
general admission or with such restriction as the Court sees fit to 
impose. 

Provisional 	 6. 	Any person who holds a law degree or other legal 
admission. 

	

	qualification from any Commonwealth or other comparable 
jurisdication that would, had he been resident in that jurisdiction, 
have entitled him to apply there for admission, or any person 
who is entitled to practise in any such jurisdiction but has done 
so for less than two years immediately preceding the application, 
may apply for provisional admission to practise in Solomon 
Islands. 



120 

7. 	(1) 	Every application for provisional admis- Application 

sion shall be by way of petition to the Court together with.. 	for provision- 
al admission. 

(a) an affidavit verifying that the petitioner is 
qualified for admission in a Commonwealth or other 
comparable jurisdiction or is entitled to practise in such 
jurisdiction but has not so practised for a period of at 
least two years immediately preceding the application; 

(b) a true copy of the certificate or other 
document testifying to the petitioner's legal qualification 
or his entitlement to practise; and 

(c) evidence that he is still so qualified or 
entitled to practise in such jurisdiction at the time of the 
application. 

	

(2) 	Where the petitioner is entitled to practise but has 
practised for less than two years in addition to the documents 
mentioned in subrule (1), the petitioner shall also forward - 

(a) a certificate under the hand and seal of the 
proper authority in that behalf (which shall include a 
statement that the person giving the certificate is the 
proper authority) that the petitioner is still entitled to 
practise in that court; and 

(b) a certificate under the hand and seal of a 
judge of the court before or to which the petitioner has 
last practised or been attached that the petitioner is a fit 
and proper person to be admitted as a legal practitioner of 
the court. 

	

8. 	(1) 	Any person claiming to be admitted under Admission 
under section 

the provisions of section 4 of the Act, on or before the day he 4 of the Act. 
commences service with the Government in any of the offices 
specified in that section shall submit to the Registrar a declara-
tion on Form 1 of the First Schedule. 

	

(2) 	On receipt of such a notice, the Registrar shall 
verify the facts on the notice and on finding them to be correct 
shall endorse the declaration and make arrangements for the 
declarant to make and subscribe to the oath prescribed under rule 
13. 



121 

Restrictions 	 9. 	(1) 	Any person who has been provisonally 
in relation to 	admitted and any person admitted under section 4 of the Act 
admission. 	

unless he fulfils the requirements of rule 3,for a period of twelve 
months following that provisional admission or admission work 
in the office of the Attorney-General, Director of Public 
Prosecutions, Public Solicitor or Registrar-General or in the 
office of a private practitioner with at least five years practical 
legal experience in Solomon Islands certified by the Chief 
Justice under his hand and the seal of the High Court as a fit per-
son so to supervise a provisionally admitted legal practitioner. 

(2) 	For the said period of twelve months the provi- 
sionally admitted practitioner or practitioner admitted under 
section 4 of the Act who does not fulfil the requirements of rule 
3 shall not - 

(a) during the first six months appear as an 
advocate in the High Court or the Court of Appeal or 
issue any process, draft pleadings or give legal opinion in 
his own name but may undertake any other work as a 
legal practitioner; 

(b) during the second six months appear as an 
advocate in the High Court or the Court of Appeal but 
may undertake any other work as a legal practitioner; or 

(c) during the whole period of twelve months 
hold money in trust for a client. 

Application 	 10. 	(1) 	On the completion of the said twelve 
for admission month period any practitioner provisionally admitted may apply to practise 
without 	for admission on Form 2 of the First Schedule and any practi- 
restriction. 	tioner admitted under section 4 of the Act who does not fulfil the 

requirements of rule 3 may apply on Form 3 of the First 
Schedule to be permitted to practise without restriction. Each 
such application shall be accompanied by - 

(a) 	an affidavit from the practitioner in charge 
of the office in which or the certified private practitioner 
with whom the applicant has served his twelve months 
restricted practice, stating - 



- 1iddy 
TO TJflO) oqi JO iinoD q2'H oqj JO o2pnf aiojoq uoiiauijj JO 

-;)jvo!pjQo jo qio 2uimojtoj qj oi  oqusqns pu 	IIuosAoJd 
UU1OSJOpUO 	o p3littupu si q ojojoq 11-s  junilddr u 	(j) 	j 

° qwo 
3 olninpun uonijpp 

JO osrD qj U! OOJ OU oq 1p(S OJI1 Tflq uoissiwpi3  1EUOSA 
-ojd io uotssiwpe ioj uoprottddu iWAO uo pnd oq jqs npqo 
puo 	in ino ios sj uoiii?oitddu oql 	j 

u0T)3ijddV 
udoiddi 

Jpisuoc jqs ino:) oqj su 3opomd stq jo swJai 
qi O1 S suopoojip qons qIM pUU sqiniow OAIOMT  fUl 

-p000xo IOU poud L,  ioj uououisoi jo poud oqi jo uoTs 
-suup 1uo1siAoJd sq JO pouod olqj puoxo 'pxloq oq oi 
Awrnjbddo ur juvaildduoT.p 2UIA12 ij 	(q) 

10 tuoijoillsoi U1O14!M OS!2D1d 
ol ulrq mollu io JouoTTqoud .3qj jlUlpu(E) 

JO uo!sux 
10 U0OTL1SJ 	

-. ,cw ino 

	

uoTssiiupv 3'1 01 0ITJ iOpUfl UO3O!idd U1 JO idpow UO 	TI 

	

.iopun ponsst uoissrwpv jo olrogpioo oqi 	(o) 

pui UOfl?iO0SSV 0q1 JO SOflJ 

oqi iopun pouqdtostp zstmj,3qloio popuodsns uooq Jo 
oq 011 Os OSO3 IOU SIM4 pur uoij-epossV 01411 JO ioquioui 
u si 11uoi[dd oqi wqi spusj uouiojos jo uouiioossy 

	

iq oql jo xxojoJogs oql uioij oo JJoo v 	(q) 

osm oili oq i1411  Ji'uoTssuup 
JOj UoSJOd iodoid pu ij p sr 2uoi1dd 

0q1 opopouj sjuouociop oqj o 	(Al) 

puL,  UOIIOUIISOJ  jnoqjjm 0sfl01d 
01 10 pofliwp oq ol A2q11ns sjuoijddi 

	

oqi 011 su 11uouodop 01411 jo uorutdo 01411 	(tu) 

i0UOfl4oJd 10,31 t s cpodoid 

	

JJOSUJE14 p011onpuo S14 iuoqdd z)ql juqi 	(i) 

6 glyu UI  InO 105 SUO13TU11SUI 

	

1411 pOAJOSqO sq wuoilddu oqj iqi 	Q) 

zz I 



123 

44 	 I. do swear (or 
do solemnly, sincerely and truly declare and affirm) that 
I will truly and honestly conduct myself as a legal practi-
tioner of Solomon Islands according to the best of my 
knowledge and ability. (And in the case of an oath) 
So help me God". 

(2) After the applicant has made and subscribed the 
oath and has been admitted or provisionally admitted whether 
under section 4 of the Act or otherwise, the judge of the Court 
shall the same day certify that fact under his hand and the seal of 
the High Court on Form 4 of the First Schedule. 

(3) When the admission is provisional or subject to 
restriction under rule 9, the judge shall endorse the certificate 
accordingly. 

(4) On completion of the period of provisonal admis- 
sion or on the removal of restrictions the judge shall endorse the 
certificate accordingly. 

Production of 	 14. 	(1) 	On production by the practitioner of the 
certificate, 

	

	certificate mentioned in rule 13, and payment of the prescribed 
enrolment fee, the Registrar shall enter on the Roll kept by him 
under section 6 of the Act the name of the person admitted and 
shall certify that he has done so on the aforementioned certifi-
cate. 

(2) When the admission is provisonal or subject to 
restrictions under rule 9, the Registrar shall mark the Roll 
accordingly. 

(3) On completion of the period of provisional 
admission or on the removal of restriction, the Registrar shall 
mark the Roll accordingly. 

(4) A legal practitioner may not appear as an advo- 
cate before any court in Solomon Islands until his name has been 
entered on the Roll. 

Admission 	 15. 	Subject to the provisions of rules 5, 6, 9 and 10, 
without limit 	the Court shall admit legal practitoners without limit of time: 
of time. 



124 

Provided that, if the person admitted is not a citizen or 
resident of Solomon Islands, the admission may be limited to 
such shorter period as the Court may consider appropriate as the 

case may be. 

16. 	(1) 	(a) 	Every person admitted or provi- Practising 

sonally admitted shall be issued with a practising certificate upon certificate. 

payment of the additional fee and such certficate shall be valid to 
the end of the calendar year in which they are admitted or provi-
sonally admitted. 

(b) Every person practisifng in Solomon 
Islands shall during the month of January each year apply f o r 
a current practising certificate. Every practising certificate shall 
be valid for the calendar year in which it is issued or in the case 
of admissions under the proviso to rule 15 for such shorter 
period as the case may be. 

(c) All practising certificates shall be on 
Form 5 of the First Schedule. 

(d) On each application for renewal of a 
practising certificate a declaration shall be made on Form 6 of 
the First Schedule and the fee prescribed in the Second Schedule 
shall be paid except that any person admitted under section 4 of 
the Act will not be liable to pay any fee. 

(e) On receipt of such an application and of 
the fee prescribed in the Second Schedule when appropriate, the 
Registrar shall issue a practising certificate unless he has cause 
to believe the declaration on Form 6 of the First Schedule is not 
correct in any particular. Where for any reason the Registrar 
declines to issue a certificate he shall within fourteen days certi-
fy to the applicant and the Court his belief and the reason there-
for. 



125 

(2) Any person who is aggrieved by the Registrar's 
decision may apply to the Court ex parte by notice of motion for 
an order that the certificate be issued. 

(3) If a legal practitioner who has obtained a practis-
ing certificate neglects for three months after the expiration of 
that certficate to obtain a fresh certificate and subsquently 
applies therefor, the Registrar shall not issue such a certificate 
but shall require the applicant to submit his reasons for failing to 
apply together with a declaration on Form 7 of the First Schedule 
that he has not practised at any time since the end of the month 
of January following the expiration of the certificate until the 
date of such application. 

(4) On receipt of such a statement the Registrar shall 
forward it to the Chief Justice who may direct the Registrar to 
issue a fresh certificate on such terms and conditions (if any) as 
he may think fit or may refuse to issue such a certificate. 

Discretion of 	 17. 	Nothing in rule 16 shall restrict the discretion of 
the Chief 	the Chief Justice to refuse to issue a practising certificate to any 
Justice. 	practitioner, who has been found guilty of a criminal offence or 

of any offence of professional misconduct. 

Making false 	 18. 	Any person who knowingly makes a false state- 
statement in 	ment in any document or application under these Rules shall be 
any docu- 
ment or 	guilty of an offence and liable to a fine of five hundred dollars. 
application. 	Such an offence shall constitute professional misconduct. 

Transitional 	 19. 	Any legal practitioner who, on the day these 
provisions. 	Rules come into force, is admitted under the Rules referred to in 

rule 2 of these Rules shall be deemed to be properly admitted as 
a legal practitioner under these Rules. 



126 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

Form 1 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

DECLARATION THAT SECTION 4 APPLIES 

(Rule 8) 

I..................................................................................................... 

of.................................................................................................... 

on the 	 day of 	 19 	started 

employment in an office of the Government for which a legal 

qualification is required. 

I THEREFORE DECLARE that from the abovementioned date 

I am entitled to admission as a legal practitioner under the pro-

visions of section 5. 

I APPLY to take the oath under rule J8 of the Legal Practitioners 

(Admission) Rules 1996 and to have my name entered on the 

Roll of Practitioners. 



127 

Dated this 	 day of 	 19 

Confirmed with the Judicial and Legal Commission this 
day of 	 19 

Registrar 

Form 2 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

APPLICATION FOR ADMISSION ON COMPLETION 
OF TWELVE MONTHS PROVISIONAL ADMISSION 

(Rule 10) 

I..................................................................................................... 
of................................................................................................... 
was provisionally admitted as a legal practitoner in Solomon 
Islands on the 	 day of 	19 

I HEREBY DECLARE that for the period of six months from 
the 	 day of 	 19 	to 
the 	 day of 	 19 	I 
was working under 	 of 
and during that time I did not appear as an advocate in the High 
Court or the Court of Appeal or do anything prohibited under 
rule 9(2). 

I FURTHER DECLARE that for the further period of six months 
from the 	day 	of 	19 	to the 	day of 

19 	I was working under 	 of 
and during that time I did not appear as an advocate in the High 
Court or the Court of Appeal. 

I FURTHER DECLARE that there has been no change in the 



qualifications and entitlement to practise described in my peti- 
tion dated the 	 day of 	 19 
and presented when I applied for provisional admission (save 
for.) 

I FURTHER DECLARE that I truly believe I am now qualified 
for admission as a legal practitioner. 

AND I APPLY to be admitted as a legal practitioner. 

Dated this 	 day of 	 19 

Form 3 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

APPLICATION FOR REMOVAL OF 
RESTRICTIONS ON PRACTICE 

(Rule 10) 

I..................................................................................................... 
of................................................................................................... 

on the 	 day of 	 19 
started employment in an office of the Government for which a 
legal qualification is required and was therefore admitted as a 
legal practitioner under section 4 of the Act but did not fulfil the 
requirements of rule 3. 

I HEREBY DECLARE that for the period of six months from the 
day of 	 19 	to the 
day of 	 19 	I was work- 

ing under 	 of 
and during the time I did not appear as an advocate in the High 
Court or the Court of Appeal. 



129 

I HEREBY DECLARE that I truly believe I am a fit person to 
practise without restriction. 

AND, THEREFORE, APPLY to be permitted to act as a legal 
practitioner free of the restrictions under rule 10 of the Legal 
Practitioners (Admission) Rules 1996. 

Dated this 	 day of 	 19 

Form 4 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

IN THE HIGH COURT OF SOLOMON ISLANDS 
CERTIFICATE OF ADMISSION 

(Rule 13) 

BE IT KNOWN TO ALL MEN that 
of 
was on the 	 day of 	 19 
admitted in the High Court of Solomon Islands as a legal practi-
tioner and an officer of the Court. 

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I, 
have hereunto set my hand and the seal of the said Court this 

day of 	 19 

Judge of the Court 
ENROLLED this 	 day of 	 19 

Registrar 
(Provisional) (Restricted) admission on the 	 day 
of 	 19 

Registrar 
Full admission on the 	 day of 	19 



130 

Registrar. 

Form 5 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(NO. 14 OF 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

PRACTISING CERTIFICATE 

(Rule 16) 

I hereby certify that 
whose place of business is at 

has this day left with the Registrar of the High Court a declara-
tion in writing in accordance with rule 16 of the Legal 
Practitioners (Admission) Rules 1996 and hereby further certify 
that the said 
is entitled to practise as a legal practitioner from that address for 
the year of 19 

Dated this 	 day of 	19 

Registrar 

Form 6 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987) 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

DECLARATION FOR OBTAINING PRACTISING 
CERTIFICATE 

(Rule 16) 

I, 



131 

hereby declare that I was (provisionally) admitted as a legal 
practitioner on the 	 day of 	 19 
and that my place of business is 

I FURTHER DECLARE that during the last twelve months I 
have not been suspended or otherwise prevented from practising 
(except 

Dated this 	 day of 	 19 

Form 7 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1987 
(No. 14 of 1987). 

THE LEGAL PRACTITIONERS (ADMISSION) 
RULES 1996 

DECLARATION AFTER FAILING TO RENEW 
PRACTISING CERTIFICATE 

(Rule 16) 

I, 	 of 
was admitted as a legal practitioner on the 	 day 
of 	 19 
I was last issued with a practitising certificate on the 

day of 	 19 	entitling 
me to practise from the abovementioned address for the period 
of one year and the certificate expired on the thirty-first day of 
December 19 

I HEREBY DECLARE that I have not carried on the business of 
a legal practitioner or acted in any way as a legal practitioner 
from the thirty-first day of January 19 	to the day of 
this declaration. 



132 

Dated this 	 day of 	19 

SECOND SCHEDULE 

FEES 

$ 

Application for admission 	 200 

Application for provisional admission 	 80 

Enrolment 	 300 

Enrolment on completion of period of 	 100 
provisional admission or period of restriction 
under section 4 

Renewal of practising certificate 	 200 

Renewal of practising certificate whilst still 	80 
provisionally admitted 

Made by me at Honiara this ninth day of August 1996. 

SIR (GILBERT) JOHN BAPTIST MURIA 
Chief Justice 

Approved by Parliament this second day of December 1996, 

Clerk to National Parliament 

Dated at Honiara this second day of December 1996. 

SIR (GILBERT) JOHN BAPTIST MURIA 
Chief Justice 


