
5 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon islands Gazette 

Tuesday 31st January, 2006 	 S.I. No. 2 r. 

EXTRA ORDINARY GAZETTE 

The following are published as a Supplement to this Gazette: 
[Legal Notice No: 2] 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (PUISNE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006) 



THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

Regulation: 

1. CITATION 

2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 OF L.N. 142 OF 1990 

3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 

4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 

5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 9 

6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 

7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 16 

8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 17 

9. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 25 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDI-
TIONS OF SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGE) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of 
the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the 
Minister hereby makes the following regulations - 

Citation 	1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the 

Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of 

Service) (Puisne Judge) (Amendment) 



7 

Regulations 2006, and shall be deemed to have come into 

force on 1st January, 2006. 

Amendment 2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms 

of regulation 	and Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judge) Regu- 

4 	 lations (hereinafter referred to as the "princi- 

pal Regulations" is hereby deleted and the 

following substituted therefor - 

"Salary 	4. 	The Puisne Judge shall be paid a 

taxable salary of $5,000.00 per fort-

night." 

Amendment 3. 	Regulation 6 of the principal Regulations is hereby 

of regulation 	amended by deleting the full stop at the end of 

6 	 sentence and substituting therefor the following - 

"or in the absence of rent free accommodation and 

at the option of the officer, he shall receive a 

housing allowance of $5,000.00 per month." 

Amendment 4. 	Regulation 7 of the principal Regulations 

of regulation 	is hereby amended by deleting the full stop at the 

7 	 end of the sentence and substituting therefor the 

following - 

"or at the option of the officer, he shall receive a 

utilities allowance of $1,300.00 per month." 

Amendment 5. 	Regulation 9 of the principal Regulations 

of regulation 	is hereby amended by deleting the full stop at the 

9 	 end of the sentence and substituting therefor the 

following - 

"and shall also be paid a fuel allowance of $500.00 

per month." 



Amendment 6. 	Regulation 13(1) of the principal Regulations is 

of regulation 	hereby amended by deleting the figure "US$55.00" 

13 	 and substituting therefor the figure "US$250.00". 

Amendment 7. 	Regulation 16 of the principal Regulations is 

of regulation 	hereby amended by deleting the figure "$2,000.00" 

16 	 and substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00". 

Amendment 8. 	Regulation 17 of the principal Regulations is 

of regulation 	hereby amended by deleting the existing regulation 

17 	 and substituting therefor the following new regula- 

tion - 

"Clothing 	17. 	The Puisne Judge shall be 

allowance 	paid a clothing allowance of 

$10,000.00 per annum." 

Insertion 	9. 	The principal Regulations is hereby amended by 

of new 	 inserting immediately after regulation 24 the 

regulation 	following new regulation as regulation 25 as 
25 	 follows - 

"Education 	25. 	The Puisne Judge shall be 

grant 	 paid an Education grant of 

$5,000.00 per annum." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



9 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (GOVERNOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 2006 



10 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) (GOVERNOR-GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 
2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 2(1) OF L.N. 140 

OF 1990 
3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 9 
4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 10 
5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 12 
6. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 
7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 
8. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 22 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) (GOVERNOR-GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the 
Minister hereby makes the following regulations - 

Citation 	1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of 
Service) (Governor-General) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2006, and shall be deemed to have 
come into force with effect from 1st January, 2006. 



11 

2. Regulation 2 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 	Amendment 

Conditions of Service) (Governor-General) Regulations 	of regulation 

(hereinafter referred to as the "principal Regulations") is 	2(1) of LN 140 

hereby amended by deleting paragraph (1) and substituting of 1990 
therefor the following - 

(1) 	The Governor-General shall be 
paid a fortnightly salary of $5,000.00. 

3. Regulation 9(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby 	Amendment 
amended by deleting the words "forty dollars" and substitu- of regulation 9 
ting therefor the words "three hundred dollars". 

4. Regulation 10(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby 	Amendment 

deleted and the following new regulation substituted therefor of regulation 10 

(1) 	Subject to the provisions of paragraph (2) the Governor - 
General shall be entitled on official overseas travel to an 
allowance of US$300.00 per day. 

5. Regulation 12(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby 	Amendment 
amended by deleting the words "six thousand" and substituti-of regulation 12 
tuting therefor the words "ten thousand". 

6. The principal Regulation is hereby amended by inserting 	Insertion 

therein immediately after regulation 12 the following as 	of new 

regulation 12A - 	 regulation 

"Education 	12A. The Governor-General shall be entitled to an 
allowance 	annual education grant of $5,000.00 

7. Regulation 14(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby 	Amendment 
deleted and the following new regulation substituted thereof- of regulation 14 



12 

64 	 (1) 	The Governor - General shall be entitled to 
an annual clothing allowance of "fifteen 
thousand dollars". 

Insertion 	8. 	The principal Regulation is hereby amended by 
of new 	 inserting immediately after regulation 21 the 
regulation 	following new regulation as regulation 22 - 

22 	"Pension 	22. 	The Governor - General shall be 
entitle to pension at the rate of 45% 
of his basic annual salary." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



13 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 



14 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006) 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 
2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 OF L.N. 144 OF 1990 
3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 
4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 
5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 9 
6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 12 
7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 
8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 
9. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 23 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS SER-
VICE) (SPEAKER) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister here-
by makes the following regulations - 

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) (Speaker) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2006, and shall be deemed to have come into 
force with effect from 1st January, 2006. 

(1) 	The Governor - General shall be paid a fortnightly 
salary of $5,000.00." 



15 

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions Amendment 
of Service) (Speaker) Regulations(hereinafter referred to as the 	of regulation 
"principal Regulations") is hereby amended by deleting the words 4 

"salary of $62,673.03" and substituting therefor the words 
"fortnightly salary of $5,500.00". 

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulation ishereby amended by 
deleting the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and 	Amendment 

substituting therefor the words "or in the absence of a rent free 	of regulation 

accommodation and at the option of the officer, he shall receive 	6 

a housing allowance of $5,000.00 per month". 

4. Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 

deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 

therefor the following words "or at the option of the officer, he 	7 

shall receive a utilities allowance of $1,300.00 per month." 

5. Regulation 9 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and 	of regulation 

substituting therefor the following words "and shall also receive 	9 

a fuel allowance of $500.00 per month." 

6. Regulation 12 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the existing regulation and substituting therefor the 	of regulation 

following new regulation as regulation 12 and 12A respectively - 	12 

"Overseas 	12. 	(1) 	The Speaker shall be entitled to 
allowance 	 US$250.00 travelling allowance per 

day whilst travelling overseas. 

(2) 	Where the wife accompanies the 
Speaker on official overseas trips. 



she shall be eligible to 50% of the travelling allowance 
of the Speaker. 

Local 	12A. The Speaker shall be eligible to receive 
travel 	 $250.00 local travel allowance per day. 

Amendment 7. Regulation 14 of the principal Regulation is hereby 
of regulation amended by deleting the figure "$2,000.00" and 
14 substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00.,,  

Amendment 8. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulation is hereby of 
regulation 15 amended by deleting the existing regulation and 

substituting therefor the following - 

"Clothing 	15. 	The Speaker shall be entitled to a clothing 
allowance 	allowance of $10,000.00 per annum." 

Insertion of 9. The principal Regulation is hereby amended by inserting 
new immediately after regulation 22 the following new 

regulation 23 as follows - 

regulation 23 "Education 	23. 	The Speaker shall receive an education 
grant 	 grant of $5,000.00 per annum." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



17 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN OF PUBLIC SERVICE 

COMMISSION) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 



111 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) ( CHAIRMAN OF PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION) 
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006) 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 
2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 
3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 
4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 
5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 8 
6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 10 
7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 
8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 
9. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 17 
10. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 25 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS SER-
VICE) (CHAIRMAN OF PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION) (AMEND-
MENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister hereby makes the following 
regulations - 

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) (Chairman of Public Service 
Commission) (Amendment) Regulations 2006, and shall be 
deemed to have come into force with effect from 1st January, 
2006. 



19 

Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of 	Amendment 

Service) (Chairman of Public Service Commission)Regulations (here- of regulation 
inafter referred to as the "principal Regulations") is hereby amended by 4 
deleting the existing regulation and substituting therefor the following 
new regulation - 

"Salary 	4. 	The Chairman shall be paid a taxable 	Amendment 
fortnightly salary of $4,000.00." 	 of regulation 

6 
Regulation 6 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by deleting 
the figure "$2,000.00" and substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00". 

	

4. 	Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by deleting Amendment 
the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and substitutin 	of regulation 

therefor the words " or in the absence of rent free accommodation and at 
the option of the Chairman, he shall be paid a housing allowance of 
$5,000.00 per month. 

Regulation 8 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by deleting Amendment 
the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 

therefor the words "or at the option of the Chairman, he shalireceive a 8 
utilities allowance of $1,300.00 per month." 

Regulation 10 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by deleting Amendment 
the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 

therefor the following words "and a fuel allowance of $500.00 	10 

per month". 

	

7. 	Regulation 14 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by deleting Amendment 
the figure "US$55.00" and substituting therefor the figures "US$250.00". of regulation 

14 



Amendment 	8. 	Regulation 15 of the principal Regulation is hereby 
of regulation 	amended by deleting the figure "$40.00"and substituting 
15 	 therefor the figure "$150.00." 

Amendment 	9. 	Regulation 17 of the principal Regulation is hereby 
of regulation 	deleted and the following new regulation substituting 
17 	 therefor - 

"Clothing 	17. 	The Chairman shall be paid a clothing 
allowance 	 allowance of $10,000.00 per year." 

Insertion of 	10. 	The principal Regulation is hereby amended by inserting 
new 	 immediately after regulation 24 the following new 
regulations 	 regulation as regulation 25 - 
25 

"Education 	25. 	The Chairman shall be paid an 
allowance 	 education allowance of $5,000.00 

per annum." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



21 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 



22 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 
2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 
3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 
4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 
5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 8 
6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 10 
7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 
8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 
9. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 17 
10. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 25 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS SER-
VICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister hereby makes the following 
regulations - 

	

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) (Ombudsman) (Amendment) 
Regulations and shall be deemed to have come into force on 
1st January, 2006. 



23 

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 	Amendment 

of Service) (Ombudsman) Regulations (hereinafter referred to as 	of regulation 

the "princpal Regulations") is hereby amended by deleting the 	4 

words "an annual taxable salary of $59,224.75" and substituting 

therefor the words "a fortnightly taxable salary of $4,000.00". 

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure"$2,000.00" and substituting therefor the 	of regulation 

figure "$10,000.00". 	 6 

4. Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 

therefor the words "or in the absence of rent free accommodation 	7 

and at the option of the officer, he shall receive a housing 
allowance of $5,000.00 per month". 

5. Regulation 8 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by Amendment 
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting of regulation 

therefor the following words "or at the option of the officer, he 8 

shall be entitled to utilities allowance of $1,300.00 per month." 

7. 	Regulation 14 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by Amendment 
deleting the figure "US$55.00" and substituting therefor the of regulation 

figure "US$250.00". 14 

8. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure "$40.00" and substituting therefor the figure 	of regulation 

"$150.00". 	 15 

9. Regulation 17 of the principal Regulation is hereby deleted and 	Amendment 
the following substituted therefor - 	 of regulation 

17 
"Clothing 	17. the Ombudsman shall be paid a clothing 
allowance 	allowance of $10,000.00 per annum." 



24 

Insertion of 	10. 	The principal Regulation is hereby amended by inserting 
new 	 immediately after regulation 24 the following new 
regulation 	 regulation as regulation 25 - 
25 

"Education 	25. 	The Ombudsman shall be paid a 
allowance 	education allowance of $5,000.00 

per annum." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



25 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
2006 



26 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) ( CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

CITATION 

2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 

3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 

4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 

5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 9 

6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 

7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 

8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 16 

9. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 24 



27 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister hereby makes the following 
regulations - 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms Citation 
and Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice)(Amendment) Regulations 
2006, and shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from 
1st January, 2006. 

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Amendment 
Service) (Chief Justice) Regulations (hereinafter referred to as the 	of regulation 

"principal Regulations") is hereby amended by deleting the words 	4 

"salary of $110,00.00"and substituting therefor the words"fortnightly 
salary of $5,000.00". 

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 
therefor the words "or in the absence of a rent free accommodation 	6 

and at the option of the officer, he shall receive a housing allowance 	- 
of $5,000.00 per month." 

4. Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting 	of regulation 

herefor the 	 7 

following "or at the option of the officer, he shall receive a utilities 
allowance of $1,300.00 per month." 

Amendment 	5. 	Regulation 9 of the principal Regulation is hereby 



of regulation 	amended by deleting the full stop at the end of the 
9 	 sentence and substituting therefor the following 

words "and shall also receive a fuel allowance of 
$500.00 per month. 

Amendment 	6. 	Regulations 14 of the principal Regulation is here by 
of regulation 	amended by deleting the figure "$210.00" and 
14 	 substituting therefor the figure "$250.00". 

Amendment 	7. 	Regulation 15 of the principal Regulation is hereby 
of regulation 	amended by deleting the figure "$4,000.00" and 
15 	 substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00',. 

Amendment 	8. 	Regulation 16 of the principal Regulation is hereby 
of regulation 	deleted and the following substituted therefor - 
16 

"Clothing 	16. 	The Chief Justice shall be paid a 
allowance 	 clothing allowance of $10,000.00 

per annum." 

Insertion 9. 	The principal Regulation is hereby amended by 
of inserting immediately after regulation 23 a new 
new regulation 24 as follows - 

regulation 24 "Education 	24. 	The Chief Justice shall receive an 
grant 	 education grant of $5,000.00 per 

annum." 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



PA 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (ATTORNEY GENERAL) REGULATIONS 2006 



30 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (ATTORNEY GENERAL) REGULATIONS 2006) 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1.  CITATION 

2.  TERM OF OFFICE 

3.  DUTIES 

4.  SALARY 

5.  NPF CONTRIBUTIONS 

6.  APPOINTMENT GRANT 

7.  HOUSING 

8.  UTILITIES 

9.  DOMESTIC SERVANTS 

10.  VEHICLE 

11.  LEAVE 

12.  PASSAGE 

13.  COMPASSIONATE LEAVE 

14.  OVERSEAS TRAVEL ALLOWANCE 



31 

15. LOCAL TRAVEL ALLOWANCE 

16. CLASS OF TRAVEL (OVERSEAS VISITS) 

17. CLOTHING ALLOWANCE 

18. ENTERTAINMENT ALLOWANCE 

19. MEDICAL TREATMENT 

20. PERSONAL LOAN 

21.  BAGGAGE ALLOWANCE 

22.  DEATH DURING INCUMBENCY 

23.  MISCELLANEOUS BENEFITS 

24.  EDUCATION ALLOWANCE 



32 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (ATTORNEY-GENERAL) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister here-
by makes the following regulations - 

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of 
Service) (Attorney -General) Regulations 2006, and 

shall be deemed to have come into force with effect 
from 1St January, 2006. 

Term of2. 	The term of office of the Attorney General shall 
office 	 be permanent unless otherwise specified in a con- 

tract of employment. 

Duties 	3. 	The duties of the Attorney General shall be 	as laid 
down in section 42 of the Constitution. 

Salary 	4. 	The Attorney General shall be paid a fortnightly 
salary of $5,000.00. 

NPF 	5. The Attorney General shall make contributions to 
contribution the National Provident Fund as required under the 
Cap. 109 provisions of Solomon Islands National Provident 

Fund Act. 

Appointment 6. The Attorney General shall on first appointment 
grant receive an appointment grant of $10,000.00. 

Housing 	7. The Attorney General shall be provided with an 
official residence free of rent or in the absence of 
a rent free accommodation and at the option of the 
officer he shall receive a housing allowance of 
$5,000.00 per month. 



33 

Utilities 	8. 	The cost of water, gas,telephone and electricity 
provided to the residence of the Attorney General 
shall be charged to public funds and be paid for by 
the Government or at the option of the officer he 
shall receive a utilities allowance of $1,300.00 per 
month. 

Domestic 	9. 	The wages payable for the service of one domestic 
servants 	 employee and a gardener shall be charged to public 

funds and paid for by the government. 

Vehicle 	10. 	The Attorney General shall be provided with one 
rent free official vehicle and a fuel allowance of 
$500.00 per month. 

Leave 	11. 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to leave at 
the rate of three and half days a month or forty-two 
days per annum for each year of completed service, 
which leave shall be taken during the year in which 
it accrues. 

Passage 	12. 	(1) 	The Attorney General and members of his 
family shall be provided with sea or air 
passages as appropriate to his home village 
and return passages to Honiara when 
proceeding on annual leave. 

(2) 	In this regulation "home village" includes 
the home village of the spouse. 

Compas- 	13. 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to two return 
sionate leave 	trips either by sea or air within Solomon Islands on 

compassionate leave per annum. 

Overseas 	14. 	(1) 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to a 
travel 	 daily subsistence allowance of US$250.00 
allowance 	 whilst on overseas travel or one-fifth of the 

daily allowance if the travel is externally 
funded. 

(2) 	where the Attorney General is a guest of a 
host government, administration or agency 



34 

and is not called upon to meet costs for 
accommodation and meals, he may claim 
subsistence allowance at the rate of one-fifth 
of his daily subsistence allowance 
entitlement. 

Local travel 15. 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to a daily 
allowance 	travel allowance of $150.00 whilst on official travel 

within Solomon Islands. 

Class of 	16. 	(1) 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to 
travel 	 travel first class on all official overseas 
(overseas visits) 	 visits. 

(2) 	The spouse of the Attorney General shall be 
entitled to travel first class when accom-
panying the Attorney General on any official 

• visit overseas and shall be entitled to claim 
subsistence allowance at the rate payable to 
the Attorney General in regulation 14(1). 

Clothing 17. The Attorney General shall be entitled to clothing 
allowance allowance of $10,000.00 per annum. 

Entertain- 18. The Attorney General, shall be entitled to an 
ment entertainment allowance. The amount of the allow- 
allowance ance shall be as determined by the Accounting Offi- 

cer of the Ministry responsible for Justice and 
Legal Affairs. 

Medical 19. The Attorney General shall be entitled to medical 
treatment treatment in accordance with the terms prescribed 

from time to time for public officers. 

Personal 	20. 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to a 
loan 	 Government guaranteed loan, the maximum amount 

of which shall not exceed his annual basic salary. 



35 

Baggage 	21. 	Subject to the provisions of Chapter F of General 
allowance 	Orders, the Attorney General shall be entitled to 

claim baggage allowance. 

Death during 22. 	Where the Attorney General dies whilst in 
incumbency 	office, the Government shall be responsible 

for all funeral expenses and all other expenses inci-
dental thereto. 

Mescellaneous23. 	The Attorney General shall be entitled to other 
benefits 	 benefits available to public officers under General 

Orders or other regulations which are not covered 
by these Regulations 

Education 	24. 	The Attorney General shall be paid an Education 
allowance 	allowance of $5,000.00 per annum. 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



36 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (AUDITOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 2006 



37 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) (AUDITOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 

2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4 

3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6 

4. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 6A 

5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 

6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 8 

7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 10 

9. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 

10. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 

11. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 17 



38 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (AUDITOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister here-
by makes the following regulations - 

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) (Auditor-General) 
Regulations 2006, and shall be deemed to have come into force 
with effect from 1st January, 2006. 

Amendment 	2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
of regulation 	Conditions of Service) (Auditor General) Regulations 
4 	 (hereinafter referred to as the "principal Regulations") is 

hereby amended by deleting the words "an annual 
taxable salary of $59,224.75" and inserting therefor the 
words "a fortnightly salary of $4,000.00". 

Amendment 	3. 	Regulation 6 of the principal Regulations is hereby 
of regulation 	amended by deleting the figure "$2,000.00" and 
6 	 substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00". 

Insertion 	4. 	The principal Regulation is hereby amended by inserting 
of new 	 immediately after Regulation 6 a new Regulation 6 A as 
regulation 	 follows- 
6A 



39 

"Education 	6A. The Auditor General shall receive an 

grant 	 educational grant of $5,000.00 per 
annum." 

5. Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and 	of regulation 
inserting thereafter the words "or in the absence of rent-free 	7 

accommodation and at the option of the officer, he shall receive a 
housing allowance of $5,000.00 per month". 

6. Regulation 8 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 

deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and inserting 	of regulation 

thereafter the following words "and a fuel allowance of $500.00 	8 

per month". 

7. Regulation 10 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the full stop that appears at the end of the sentence and 	of regulation 

inserting thereafter the following words "or at the option of the 	10 

officer he shall receive a utility allowance of $1,300.00 per month". 

9. Regulation 14 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure "US$55.00" and substituting therefor the figure of regulation 

"US$250.00". 	 14 

10. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure "$40." and substituting therefor the figure 	of regulation 

"$150.00,,. 	 15 

11. Regulation 17 of the principal Regulation is hereby deleted and 	Amendment 
the following substituted therefor - 	 of regulation 

17 

"Clothing 	17. 	The Auditor General shall receive 
allowance 	 a clothing allowance of $10,000.00 

per annum". 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 



40 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT) 
REGULTIONS 2006 



41 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1. CITATION 

2. AMENDMENT REGULATION 4 

3. APPOINTMENT GRANT 

4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7 

5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 8 

6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 10 

7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14 

8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15 

9. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 17 

10. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 24 



42 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister here-
by makes the following regulations - 

Citation 1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the 
Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of 
Service) (Public Solicitor)(Amendment)Regulations 

2006, and shall be deemed to have come into force 
on 1St January, 2006. 

Amendment 	2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
regulation 	 and Conditions of Service) (Public Solicitor) 	4 

Regulations (hereinafter referred to as the "prin- 
cipal Regulations") is hereby amended by 
deleting the words "an annual taxable salary of 
$59,224.75" and substituting therefor the words "a 
fortnightly taxable salary of $4,000.00". 

Appointment 3. 	Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is 
grant 	 hereby amended by deleting the figure "$2,000.00" 

and substituting therefor the figure "$10,000.00". 

Amendment 	4. 	Regulation 7 of the principal regulation is hereby 
of regulation 	amended by deleting the full stop at the end of the 
7 	 sentence and inserting thereafter the words "or in 

the absence of a rent free residence, and at the 
option of the officer he shall receive a housing 
allowance of $5,000.00 per month". 



43 

5. Regulation 8 of the principal regulation is hereby amended by 	Amendment 

deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and inserting thereafter of regulation 
the following words "or at the option of the officer he shall be paid a 8 
utility allowance of $1,300.00 per month". 

6. Regulation 10 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 

deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and inserting thereafter of regulation 
the following words "and a fuel allowance of $500.00 per month." 	10 

7. Regulation 14 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure "US$55.00" and substituting therefor the figure 	of regulation 

"US$250.00". 	 14 

8. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by 	Amendment 
deleting the figure "$40" and substituting therefor the figure "$150.00". of regulation 

15 

9. Regulation 17 of the principal Regulations is therefor - 	 Amendment 
of regulation 

"Clothing 	17. 	The Public Solicitor shall receive a clothing 	17 

allowance 	 allowance of $10,000.00 per annum." 

10. The principal regulation is hereby amended by inserting immediately Insertion of 
after regulation 23, the following as regulation 24 as follows - 	new 

regulation 24 

"Education 	24. 	The Public Solicitor shall receive an education 
allowance 	 allowance of $5,000.00 per annum". 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



IE 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN LEADERSHIP CODE COMMISION) 
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006 



45 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN LEADERSHIP CODE COMMISSION) REGU-
LATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1.  CITATION 
2.  APPOINTMENT GRANT 
3.  ALLOWANCE 
4.  HOUSING 
5.  CLOTHING 
6.  TRANSPORT 
7.  OVERSEAS TRAVEL 
8.  LOCAL TRAVEL 
9.  UTILITIES 
10.  EDUCATION 
11.  GRATUITY 



46 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN LEADERSHIP CODE COMMISSION) REGU-
LATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Prime Minister hereby makes the fol-
lowing regulations - 

Citation 	1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutiona 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) (Chairman 
Leadership Code Commission)Regulations 2006, and 
shall be deemed to have come into force with effect 
from 1st January, 2006. 

Appointment 2. 	The person appointed as Chairman shall be entitled 
on grant first appointment to a tax-free appointment 

grant of $10,000.00. 

Allowance 	3. 	The Chairman shall be paid a fortnightly allowance 
of $3,000.00. 

Housing 	4. 	The Chairman shall be paid a housing allowance of 
$5,000.00 a month. 

Clothing 	5. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to a clothing 
allowance of $10,000.00 a year. 

Transport 	6. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to an official vehicle 
or if no official vehicle is provided to a transport 
allowance of $2,000.00 per month and fuel allowance of 
$500.00 a month 



47 

Overseas 	7. 	The Chairman shall be entitled on official travel 
overseas to an allowance of US$250.00 a day. 

Local travel 8. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to a daily allowance 
of $150.00 per day whilst on official travel within 
Solomon Islands. 

Utilities 	9. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to a grant of 
$1,300.00 per month for the cost of water, gas and 
electricity. 

Education 	10. 	The chairman shall be entitled to an education grant 
of $5,000.00 per year in respect of his dependent 
children. 

Gratuity 	11. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to a gratuity of 
$20,000.00 at the end of his term of appointment. 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 
Prime Minister 



THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 

OF SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN PARLIAMENTARY 
ENTITLEMENTS COMMISSION) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2006 



49 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN PARLIAMENTARY ENTITLEMENTS COM-
MISSION) REGULATIONS 2006 

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS 

REGULATION: 

1.  CITATION 

2.  APPOINTMENT GRANT 

3.  ALLOWANCE 

4.  HOUSING 

5.  CLOTHING 

6.  TRANSPORT 

7.  OVERSEAS TRAVEL 

8.  LOCAL TRAVEL 

9.  UTILITIES 

10.  EDUCATION 

11.  GRATUITY 



50 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES 
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT 

(Cap. 84) 

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHAIRMAN PARLIAMENTARY ENTITLEMENTS COM-
MISSION) REGULATIONS 2006 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices 
(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Prime Minister hereby makes the fol-
lowing regulations - 

Citation 	1. 	These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) (Chairman 
Parliamentary Entitlements Commission) Regulations 
2006, and shall be deemed to have come into force with 
effect from 1st January, 2006. 

Appointment 2. 	The person appointed as Chairman shall be entitled 
grant 	 on first appointment to a tax-free appointment 

grant of $10,000.00. 

Allowance 	3. 	The Chairman shall be paid a fortnightly allowance 
of $3,000.00. 

Housing 	4. 	The Chairman shall be paid a housing allowacne of 
$5,000.00 a month. 

Clothing 	5. 	The Chairman shall be entitled to a clothing 
allowance of $2,000.00 a year. 

Transport 	6. 	The Chariman shall be entitled to an official vehicle 
or if no official vehicle is provided to a transport 
allowance of $2,000.00 per month and fuel 
allowance of $500.00 a month. 



51 

The Chairman shall be entitled on official travel overseas to an 	Overseas 
allowance of US$350.00 a day. 

8. The Chairman shall be entitled to a daily allowance of $150.00 per day Local travel 
whilst on official travel within Solomon Islands. 

9. The Chairman shall be entitled to a grant of $2,000.00 per month for the Utilities 
cost of water, gas and electricity. 

10. The Chairman shall be entitled to an education grant of $3,000.00 per 	
Education 

year in respect of his dependent children. 
Gratuity 

11. The Chairman shall be entitled to a gratuity of $20,000.00 at the end of 
his term of appointment. 

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006. 

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA 

Prime Minister 



Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government 

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd. 


