
5 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Wednesday 18th  February, 2009 	 S.I. No.4 

[Legal Notice No. 3] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) (COMMISSIONER OF POLICE) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 

Citation and 	 1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
commencement 

and Conditions of Service) (Commissioner of Police) (Amendment) Regulations 
2009, and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

Regulation 4 	 2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and 
amended 

	

	Conditions of Service) (Commissioner of Police) Regulations is amended by 
deleting "$4,000" and substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 



[Legal Notice No. 4] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (AUDITOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 

Citation and 	
1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 

commencement and Conditions of Service) (Auditor General) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, 
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

	

2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
Regulation 4 
amended 	of Service) (Auditor General) Regulations is amended by deleting '$4,000" and 

substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

[Legal Notice No. 5] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC PROSECUTIONS) 

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 



7 

Cimticn and 	 1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
and Conditions of Service) (Director of Public Prosecutions) (Amendment) 
Regulations 2009, and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

Regulnnoa 4 	
2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 

amended 

	

	of Service) (Director of Public Prosecutions) Regulations is amended 	deleting 
"$4,000" and substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

[Legal Notice No. 61 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHAIRPERSON PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION) 

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations 

Citation and 	 I. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
ccmmencement 

and Conditions of Service) (Chairperson Public Service Commission) 
(Amendment) Regulations 2009, and are deemed to have come into force on I 
January 2008. 

Regulation 4 	 Conditions  
amended 	 2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and  

of Service) (Chairperson Public Service Commission) Regulations is amended by 
deleting "$4,000" and substituting "$5,000". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 



8 

[Legal Notice No, 7] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 

SERVICE) ACT 
(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERViCE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred  upon nie by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -- 

crnenccr.tr. 
	 1. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 

and Conditions of Service) (Ombudsman) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and 
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

RgWaon 4 
	 2 	Reaulation 4 of tile Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 

of Service) (Ombudsman) Regulations is amended in by deleting "S4,000" and 

substituting $5,0O0". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

[Legal Notice No. 81  

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF' 
SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon roe by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -- 



citationand 
ent 	 L 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms Commencem 

and Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judges) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and 
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

Reguiion 4 	 2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
rmened 

	

	
of Service) Regulations (principal Regulations) is amended by deleting "$5,000" 
and substituting "$5,384.62'. 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

[Legal Notice No. 9] 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 209 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by Section 3 of the Constitutional 

Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 

CiaIop.a, 	 1. 	These Reulatons are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
corrnencmem 

and Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and 
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

Re-im4 	 2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
of S(rvice) (Chief Justice) Regulations ("principal Regulations) is amended by 
deleting "$5,000" and substituting "S5,961.54". 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009, 

Dr. Derek Sikua 

PRIME MINISTER 



10 

[Legal Notice No. 101 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
OF SERVICE) ACT 

(CAP. 84) 

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF 
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2009 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional 
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations - 

itation and 	 I. 	These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms 
and Conditions of Service) (Public Solicitor) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, 
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008. 

2. 	Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions 
nended 	of Service) (Public Solicitor) Regulations is amended by deleting "$4,000" and 

substituting "$5,00011 . 

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009. 

Dr. Derek Sikua 
PRIME MINISTER 

Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government 

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Limited. 


