
REPUBLIC OF VANUATU

BILL FOR
THE PUBLIC SERVICE (LOCALISATION) 
(AMENDMENT) ACT No. 35 OF 1982 1 2 3

Arrangement o£ Sections

1. Interpretation.

2. Amendments to section 2 of the principal Act.

3. Commencement.



REPUBLIC OF VANUATU

BILL FOR
THE PUBLIC SERVICE (LOCALISATION) 
(AMENDMENT) ACT No. 2.5 OF 1982

To reduce the rate of the severance payment payable to certain 
non-citizen members of the public service.

BE IT ENACTED by the President and Parliament as follows

INTERPRETATION
1. In this Act "the principal Act" means the Public Service 

(Localisation) Act No. 10 of 1982.

AMENDMENTS TO SECTION 2 OF THE PRINCIPAL ACT
2. Section 2 of the principal Act is hereby amended -

(a) in subsection (1) by deleting "3 months" and 
substituting therefor "one month";

(b) in subsection (2) by deleting "three months" and 
substituting therefor "one month".

COMMENCEMENT
3. This Act shall come into force on the day of its publication 

in the Gazette.


